MARINE ENGINEERING AND RESEARCH INSTITUTE MESS
INDIAN MARITIME UNIVERSITY - KOLKATA CAMPUS

P-19, Taratala Road, Kolkata - 700 088

Tender Notice No. IMU/KC/MERI/MESS/2031/26 Dated 05.01.2026 Last Date of Submission 20.01.2026

Rates Valid from : 01st February 2026 to 28th February 2026

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT FOR L1 OF VEGETABLES

NS(I). Vegetable :I:)gt:is 2’:::;0 Cash & L1 Firm Name
1 |Potato ( 6 to 8 pieces per Kg) 10.69 11.90 10.69 [Singh & Brothers
2 |Onion ( 10 to 12 pieces per Kg) 23.40 25.50 23.40 |Singh & Brothers
3 |Ginger 72.00 68.00 68.00 |Metro Cash & Carry
4 |Garlic 148.00 155.00 148.00 [Singh & Brothers
5 |[Green Chilly 78.00 85.00 78.00 |Singh & Brothers
6 |Lemon (22 to 25 pieces per Kg) 2.28 - 2.28 |Singh & Brothers
7 |Tomato ( 10 to 12 pieces per Kg) 23.40 38.00 23.40 |Singh & Brothers
8 |Cucumber (Deshi / Local) 58.00 78.00 58.00 |Singh & Brothers
9 |Corriander Leaves (Dhania Leaves) 40.00 35.00 35.00 |Metro Cash & Carry
10 [Cauliflower (Big Size) 21.80 35.00 21.80 |Singh & Brothers
11 |carrot 19.00 22.00 19.00 [Singh & Brothers
12 [Spring Onion 70.00 70.00 Tie |[Tie
13 |Gourd (Lauki) 19.80 26.00 19.80 |Singh & Brothers
14 |Palak Sag / Spinach 19.80 18.00 18.00 [Metro Cash & Carry
15 |Methi Sag 20.00 35.00 20.00 |Singh & Brothers
16 |[Bitter Gourd (Karela) 48.00 68.00 48.00 |Singh & Brothers
17 |Beans 44.00 57.00 44.00 |Singh & Brothers
18 |Capsicum 39.00 42.00 39.00 |Singh & Brothers
19 [Tamarind (Imli) 60.00 85.00 60.00 |Singh & Brothers
20 |Cabbage 14.80 14.00 14.00 [Metro Cash & Carry
21 [Flat Beans (Sem) 28.00 23.00 23.00 |Metro Cash & Carry
99 Pointed Gourd (Potal) ( 10 to12 pieces i i No Bid |No Bid
per kg)
23 [Ladies Finger (Bhindi) 88.00 - 88.00 |Singh & Brothers
24 |Green Mango 148.00 170.00 148.00 [Singh & Brothers
25 |Brinjal (Baigon) (4 to5 pieces per kg) 32.00 35.00 32.00 [Singh & Brothers
26 |Mint Leaves (Pudina Leaves) 100.00 70.00 70.00 |Metro Cash & Carry
27 |Currry Leaves 160.00 90.00 90.00 |Metro Cash & Carry
28 |Long Bean (Barbati) 48.00 65.00 48.00 |Singh & Brothers
29 [Radish (Muli) 22.00 32.00 22.00 |Singh & Brothers
30 |Pumpkin 17.00 13.00 13.00 [Metro Cash & Carry
31 (Green Papaya 30.00 19.00 19.00 [Metro Cash & Carry
32 [Jack Fruit (Kathal) - - No Bid |No Bid
33 |Baby corn 68.00 120.00 68.00 |Singh & Brothers
34 |Frozen Peas (1kg Pkt) 88.00 - 88.00 |Singh & Brothers
35 |Ridge Gourd (Jhinga) (5 to 6 pieces 64.00 ; 64.00 [Singh & Brothers
per kg)
36 |lvy Gourd (Kundri) 48.00 35.00 35.00 |Metro Cash & Carry
37 |Snake Gourd (Chichinga) - - No Bid | No Bid
38 |Mushroom (White) 240.00 240.00 Tie Tie
39 [Amra - - No Bid | No Bid
40 [Coconut (Big Size) 30.00 42.00 30.00 | Singh & Brothers
41 |Beetroot 19.00 22.00 19.00 | Singh & Brothers
42 |Colocasia root / Taro root (Arbi) 48.00 35.00 35.00 | Metro Cash & Carry
43 |Drumstick 130.00 220.00 130.00 | Singh & Brothers
44 |Green Peas 54.00 35.00 35.00 | Metro Cash & Carry
Ripe Banana (Big Size) (Approx. 150 3.29 3.18 3.18 | Metro Cash & Carry
45 |[gm. Each)
46 [Apple ( Approx. 150 gm. Each) 140.00 165.00 140.00 | Singh & Brothers
Orange (Big size) 14.00 - 14.00 | Singh & Brothers
47 |( Approx. 150 gm to 200 gm. Each) ’ '
Ripe Mango (Himsagar) . .
48 |(Approx. 200 gm to 250 gm. Each) i i No Bid | No Bid
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49 Ripe Papaya ( 1 kg to 1.5 kg per pc.) 56.00 55.00 55.00 | Metro Cash & Carry
50 |Dates (Khajoor) 140.00 - 140.00 | Singh & Brothers
51 |Am papad (Amsutta) 180.00 - 180.00 | Singh & Brothers

Water Melon 37.00 37.00 | Metro Cash & Carr
52 |(Approx wt. 3 kg to 4 kg/pc) ) ] Y
53 |Guava (Approx. 200 gm per pc) - 80.00 80.00 | Metro Cash & Carry
54 [Sabeda (Chikoo) = = No Bid | No Bid
55 |Grapes 125.00 190.00 125.00 | Singh & Brothers

P te (A t Pi

omegranate (Anar) 5to 6 Pieces per |, 235.00 220.00 | Singh & Brothers
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